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ABSTRACT 

Intensive migration flows within the post-Soviet spaces have maintained a relatively homogenous 
image of Russian as a persistent ‘lingua franca’ of the region; the Russian language of these mobile 
groups, however, has long become occasional rather than systematic, non-standard rather than 
normative, conversational rather than formalized (Pavlenko 2008; Ryazanova-Clarke 2014). The 
decades after the collapse of the USSR have contributed to further diversification of what once 
was known as ‘standard Russian’, taught in every Soviet educational institution, into several 
regional vernaculars (Mustajoki et al. 2010; Sociolinguistic Studies 2015). 

Once mobile migrant groups from the FSU space arrive in Russia, however, they usually face 
strong language normativity exercised in different communicative contexts, which labels them as 
‘non-native’ speakers of the language (Popova 2012). One of the recent changes that the Russian 
Federation has made to regulate its incoming migration is the introduction of compulsory testing 
in Russian language, history and legislation that every immigrant should undertake to be able to 
work in Russia officially. Given the fact that over 90% of present-day migration to Russia comes 
from FSU countries (Chudinovskikh 2015), this measure can be viewed as part of Russia’s general 
policy of enhancing the ideological value of the standardised Russian over the post-Soviet space 
(Gorham 2011; Ryazanova-Clarke 2015). What this means to FSU migrants is that language 
competence becomes a focal point for their experiences in the process of integration into the 
present-day Russian society.  

The official certification imposed by the government is aimed at constructing an idealised 
‘language profile’ a successful candidate should demonstrate (Shohamy 2001; 2013). By 
preparing for, passing through, and using the results of this procedure, migrants not only acquire 
the necessary legal status, but also undergo the critical (re)construction of their migrant identity 
(Blackledge 2009; Byrne 2012). Migrants’ own subjective interpretations of their language 
competences and ‘guises’, therefore, become integral part of their experiences: their vision of their 
own language skills changes in the larger context of migration, with inevitable social 
consequences this ‘calibration’ implies (Blommaert 2010; Phipps & Kay 2014). Migrant pathways 
are built through the events of language (mis)use as their key points, and new, experience-based 
networks of communal support are formed ad hoc (Cederberg 2014; Kramsch 2009; Nawyn et al. 
2012). Different local groups within Russian society also consider their role in the process of 
migrant integration – the variety of initiatives has sprung up to aid in resolving language-related 
problems that FSU migrants might face. Their forms may vary from amateur language courses and 
linguistic ‘first-aid’ centres to grassroots public campaigns or informational websites but what 
they all share is a wider perspective on making Russian more accessible and ‘transnational’ in its 
usage.  

The paper will discuss preliminary findings from the first stage of ethnographic fieldwork carried 
out in 2017 in Moscow and St Petersburg, supplemented by the analysis of regulatory 
documentation and teaching textbooks on language testing for migrants, as well as expert 
interviews with RFL experts.  
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